Depa	rtment	/ Requisition:	Athletics / 1	tics / 113633201 Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.										
Desci	ription	of Bid:	Cross Country Bus Charter											
Open	ing Da	te:	2/8/2019											
Prepa	ared by	:	Donna Wallis Email Address: dwallis@tntech.edu											
			GRAY LINE TN		ESTES BUS SERVICE				WISE COACHES			GENTRY TRAILWAYS		
Qty	Unit	Item Description	Unit Price	Ext. Price		Unit Price	Ext. Price		Unit Price	Ext. Price		Unit Price	Ext. P	rice
1	ea	Trip 1 - Birmingham	\$ 3.300.00	\$3,300,00		\$ 2.990.00	\$ 2.990.00		\$ 3.150.00	\$ 3.150.00		\$ 3.300.00	\$	3.300.00

	Unit	Item Description	GRAT LINE IN			ESTES BUS SERVICE				WISE COACHES		GENIRT IRAILWATS		AILWATS
Qty			Unit Price	Ext. Price		Unit Price	Ex	t. Price		Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext.	Price
1	ea	Trip 1 - Birmingham	\$ 3,300.00	\$3,300.00		\$ 2,990.00	\$	2,990.00		\$ 3,150.00	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$	3,300.00
		Trip 2 - Cape												
1	ea	Girardeau	\$ 5,850.00	\$5,850.00		no bid	\$	-		no bid	\$ -	\$ 4,400.00	\$	4,400.00
1	ea	Columbus, OH	no bid	\$ -		no bid	\$	-		no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$	
		TOTAL:		\$9,150.00			Φ.	2,990.00			\$3,150.00		\$	7,700.00
		TOTAL.		φ9,150.00			Ψ	2,990.00			\$ 3,130.00		φ	7,700.00
Intent	nt to Award Date*:		2/11/2019											
			additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above											
within	seven	(7) calendar days of th	e Intent to Aw	vard Date. A	fte	r that time, a	ddit	tional inform	nat	ion may be r	equested			
by co	ntactir	g the TTU Associate V	P of Commur	nications at w	/W\	w.tntech.edu/	'uni	vadv/ocm/c	on	tact-us				