
Department / Requisition:  (various)
Description of Bid: Lab Sciences Building Ancillary Equipment
Opening Date: 8/25/2020
Prepared by: Donna Wallis

Quantity Item Description Equivalent To: Part / Mfg. Number Unit Price Part / Mfg. Number Unit Price Part / Mfg. Number Unit Price Part / Mfg. Number Unit Price Award To:

32
Digital Pocket Scale, Black, 650 G 
X 0.1 G 

American Weigh Scale Ac- 650 Digital Pocket 
Scale, Black, 650 G X 0.1 G no bid n/a 702357 $12.43 no bid n/a no bid n/a CAROLINA

15
Kitchen Scale (5.000 kg with 2L 
stainless bowl)

Etekcity 11lb 5kg Digital Multifunction Food 
Kitchen Scale no bid n/a no bid n/a 10123-890 $340.66 no bid n/a NO AWARD

48

Top loading balance - 0.01g 
readability, 300-500g capacity, 
draft shield minimum 
requirements Fisher 14-557-432 no bid n/a 702017 $340.00 76412-354 $560.47 14-557-432 / PRACTUM412-1S $540.95 NO AWARD

20 Analytical balance Mettler XSR204 no bid n/a 702553 n/a 76292-098 $5,631.33 01-919-151/XSR204 $5,404.31 FISHER

1

Solution Calorimeter, ISO 
9001:2008, ethernet or USB 
connector Parr 6755 Solution Calorimeter no bid n/a no bid n/a 89029-776 $7,783.04 04-731-192/ 6755EA $8,547.27 VWR

2
Centrifuge, Clinical - 1000-1999 G, 
6-place fixed-angle rotor included Fisher 22-029-380 no bid n/a 214092 $351.51 95037-278 $818.18 22-029-380/00-004-018-000 $251.29 FISHER

3 Centrifuge, Benchtop Thermo Scientific 75007200 no bid n/a 214090 $1,689.77 no bid n/a 75200395 $4,077.72 FISHER

1
Centrifuge, Benchtop, 
Refrigerated  Thermo Scientific 75007203 no bid n/a 214040 $4,727.48 no bid n/a 75230395 $5,000.00 FISHER

25
Oversize Green/Magenta 3D 
Glasses, Plastic Frame, Trioscopic Oversize Ana-Pro Green/Magenta 3D Glasses no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

1 Electrochemical workstation Pine Instruments WD200-WV10-RDE no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 Nitrogen Evaporation System Fisher NC0134711 no bid n/a no bid n/a 37001-578 $16,485.98 nc0134711/11250-DA $5,626.38 FISHER

9 First aid kit (50 person) Fisher 19-090-860 no bid n/a 646514 $49.13 76049-054 $28.87 19-090-860 /  807FSCSK $113.90 VWR

9 First aid kit (24 person) Fisher 19-908-001 no bid n/a 646512 $41.72 300010-037 $33.55 19-908-001 / 019731-0018L $66.39 VWR

7 Trauma kit
Dark Angel Medical 01DARKFULLKIT-
CIVILIANSTA-RED no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

2 Freezer (-20C) Undercounter Fisher 22-651-265 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76271-350 $729.26 05LFEEFSA/ 05LFEEFSA $586.00 FISHER

1 Freezer (-80 C) Chest Fisher I920CA no bid n/a no bid n/a 10160-744 $10,745.65 I920CA/I920CA $9,413.77 FISHER
1 Freezer (-80 C) Fisher RLE60086D no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a RDE60086FDQ3 / RDE60086FDQ3 $10,942.53 FISHER

13 Freezer (-20 C) Fisher TSX2320FA no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NC1527500/ 32320H6A0ZADJ00A $5,998.49 FISHER
2 Muffle Furnace, 2.1L, 240V Fisher 10-552-1 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 10-552-1/FB1410M $1,262.79 FISHER

1
Condenser, micro cold finger, 
14/20 Chemglass CG-1222-A-02 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80067-444 $97.60 CG1222A02/CG1222A02 $25.23 FISHER

12 1000 mL round bottom flask Chemglass CG-1506-23 no bid n/a 721145 $17.94 80068-786 $29.29 CG1150623/ CG150623 $25.23 FISHER

4
Manifold, 6-port, teflon stopcocks-
left handed Chemglass CG-4430-02 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80072-432 $409.62 CG443002/ CG443002 $362.67 FISHER

4
Manifold, 6-port, teflon stopcocks-
right handed Chemglass CG-4430-04 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80072-436 $394.44 CG443004 /CG443004 $362.67 FISHER

8 Air Free bubbler to evaluate flow Chemglass EB-0513 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80064-558 $31.51 no bid n/a NO AWARD

48 Beaker, 150 mL Heavy-duty Griffin Fisher 02-555-25A no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 02-555-25A / 1003-150 $3.44 FISHER

48
Beaker, 400 mL  Heavy-duty 
Griffin Fisher 02-555-25C no bid n/a 721250 $6.95 no bid n/a 02-555-25C /1003-400 $4.79 FISHER

22
Beaker, 1000 mL Heavy-Duty 
Griffin Fisher 02-555-25F no bid n/a 721253 $15.50 no bid n/a 02-555-25F/1003-1L $9.49 FISHER

783 Scintillation vial, glass, 20 mL Fisher 03-337-4 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 03-337-4 / FS74504-20 $4.54 FISHER

24
Weighing bottle, outside, 29/12, 
40mm height Fisher 03-422C no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 03-422C/ 15146-2540 $18.98 FISHER

20
Buret, 50 mL, Class A, with 
dustcap Fisher 03-700-22C no bid n/a 738144 $48.79 no bid n/a 03-700-22C / 17027F-50 $182.49 FISHER

84 Grad. Cyl. 10 mL Vista Fisher 07-770-208 no bid n/a 721740 $4.18 no bid n/a 07-770-208/ 70075-10 $5.21 CAROLINA

VERNIER CAROLINA BIOLOGICAL VWR FISHER SCIENTIFIC



36 Gooch Crucible Fisher 08-236-1B no bid n/a 702506 $5.55 no bid n/a 08-236-1B / 32960-30M $24.77 NO AWARD
120 Grad. Cyl. 10 mL Fisher 08-550B no bid n/a 721120 $9.54 10545-968 $38.75 08-550B/08-550 $9.00 FISHER
108 Erlenmeyer flask,50 mL Fisher 10-040C no bid n/a 721148 $36.48 no bid n/a 10-040C / 4980-50 $2.65 FISHER
353 Erlenmeyer flask, 125 mL Fisher 10-040D no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 10-040D / 4980-125 $2.61 FISHER
14 Erlenmeyer flask, 250 mL Fisher 10-040F no bid n/a 721150 $34.39 no bid n/a 10-040F / 4980-250 $3.57 FISHER

12

Erlenmeyer Flasks, PYREX™ 
Graduated with Wide Mouths, 
Screw Caps Fisher 10-041-6A no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 10-041-6A / 4995-250 $35.93 FISHER

2
Conical graduated tubes, 50 mL 
(pack of 300) Fisher 12-565-271 no bid n/a 215099 $6.50 no bid n/a 12-565-271/  339653 $69.62 FISHER

72 Volumetric pipet, 5 mL Fisher 13-651-1E no bid n/a 736309 $9.42 no bid n/a 13-651-1E /  7100-5 $8.69 FISHER
72 Volumetric pipet, 10 mL Fisher 13-651-1K no bid n/a 736310 $10.22 no bid n/a 13-651-1K / 7100-10 $9.75 FISHER
72 Volumetric pipet, 25 mL Fisher 13-651-1N no bid n/a 736311 $15.16 no bid n/a 13-651-1N / 7100-25 $15.26 FISHER

110 Volumetric flask, 10 mL Fisher 13-756-690 no bid n/a 721156 $13.11 no bid n/a 13-756-690 / 92812F-10 $21.73 FISHER

104 Volumetric flask, 25 mL Fisher 13-756-692 no bid n/a 721157 $82.76 no bid n/a 13-756-692 / 92812F-25 $23.40 FISHER

60 Volumetric Flask, 50 mL Fisher 13-756-693 no bid n/a 721158 $86.26 no bid n/a 13-756-693 / 92812F-50 $23.96 FISHER

78 Volumetric flask, 100 mL Fisher 13-756-694 no bid n/a 721159 $87.40 no bid n/a 13-756-694 / 92812F-100 $29.03 FISHER

24 Volumetric flask, 250 mL Fisher 13-756-696 no bid n/a 721161 $117.84 no bid n/a 13-756-696 / 92812F-250 $379.60 FISHER

2 Volumetric flask, 1000 mL Fisher 13-756-698 no bid n/a 721163 $35.11 no bid n/a 13-756-698 / 92812F-1000 $85.38 FISHER

10
Thermo Scientific Nalgene Test 
Tube Racks: 30mm (cs/8) Fisher 14-809-49 no bid n/a 731888 $13.64 no bid n/a 14-809-49 / 5970-0430 $18.27 CAROLINA

480 Test Tube, 8" Fisher 14-956L no bid n/a 721177 $49.63 no bid n/a 14-956L / 45042-25200 $1.43 FISHER
8 Beaker, 1000 mL Fisher FB1001000 no bid n/a 731013 $37.70 no bid n/a FB1001000 / FS14000-1000 $4.86 FISHER

168 Beaker, 400 mL Fisher FB100400 no bid n/a 731010 $15.88 no bid n/a FB100400 / FS14000-400 $2.13 FISHER
32 Beaker, 50 mL Fisher FB10050 no bid n/a 731003 $25.95 no bid n/a FB10050 / FS14000-50 $1.95 FISHER

152 Beaker, 600 mL Fisher FB100600 no bid n/a 731011 $20.06 no bid n/a FB100600 / FS14000-600 $2.67 FISHER
20 Filtering flask, 500 mL Fisher FB300500 no bid n/a 726388 $19.19 no bid n/a FB300500 / FS27060-500 $13.75 FISHER

32 Mortar, 150 mL (9 cm diameter) Fisher FB961C no bid n/a 742894 $13.30 89038-148 $14.17 FB961C / J-200 $18.18 NO AWARD
32 Pestle Fisher FB961M no bid n/a 742892 $9.61 89038-164 $12.00 FB961M / J-208  $15.82 NO AWARD
96 Crucible Fisher FB965D no bid n/a 742604 $6.69 89037-992 $58.45 FB965D / J-119 $1.78 FISHER
96 Crucible cover Fisher FB965T no bid n/a 742686 $11.25 89038-008 $103.36 FB965T / J-127 $3.30 FISHER

193 Evaporating dish Fisher FB968C no bid n/a 742412 $4.07 89038-080 $122.37 FB968C / J-165 $5.91 NO AWARD
60 14/20 Glassware Kits Fisher K269320-0000 no bid n/a 725638 $294.00 no bid n/a K29320-0000 /  269320-0000 $494.88 FISHER
60 Micro Scale Glassware Kit Fisher K746200-0000 no bid n/a 725637 $200.00 no bid n/a K746200-0000 / 746200-0000 $310.02 FISHER
16 Filtering flask, 2000 mL Fisher K953760-2002 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a L953760-2002 / 953760-2002 $153.57 FISHER

40
Volumetric flask w/ snap cap, 
1000 mL Fisher S00133 no bid n/a 721163 $35.11 no bid n/a S00133 / 58008-1000/EMD $26.44 FISHER

1500 Disposable Transfer Pipets Fisher S304674 no bid n/a 736984 $4.94 no bid n/a 13-711-9AM / 13-711-9AM $0.02 FISHER

50
Grad Cylinders w/Detachable 
Plastic Base & Bumper, 100 mL Fisher S31860 no bid n/a 721746 $5.81 no bid n/a S3180 / 20025H-100/EMD $8.00 CAROLINA

16 Grad. Cyl. 100 mL Fisher S31860 no bid n/a 721746 $5.81 no bid n/a S3180 / 20025H-100/EMD $8.04 CAROLINA
202 Buret, 25 mL Fisher S32271 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a S32271 / 17021H-25/EMD $67.65 FISHER

8
Vial and microscale heating/stir 
plates Chemglass CG-1997-V-250 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76333-678 $1,088.38 50 135 4670 / CG-1997-V-250 $1,074.51 NO AWARD

187 Stirring hot plate Fisher SP88854200 no bid n/a 701012a $370.00 97042-594 $403.50 SP88854200 / SP88854200 $198.60 FISHER

4
Small Cube Ice Machine with 
Storage Bin

Scotsman C0322SA-1 Prodigy Series 22" Air 
Cooled Small Cube Ice Machine with 370 lb. 
Storage Bin with base no bid n/a 701568 $295.00 no bid n/a NON CAT NUMBERS $5,014.01 FISHER

24 Bactizapper Infrared Sterilizer SterilTech B1000-115 no bid n/a 703402 $95.76 470313-902 $287.13 no bid n/a VWR
1 Incubator Large Fisher 13-262-340 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 13-262-340 / 3920 $11,404.07 FISHER



32

Pyrex Measuring Cups, 3-Piece, 
Clear, Microwave and Oven Safe, 
includes 1-cup, 2-cup, and 4-cup 
versions Amazon B00M2J7PCI no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

4 Dewar Flasks for solvent traps Chemglass CG-1593-03 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80061-494 $155.03 CG-1593-03 / CG-1593-03 $146.64 NO AWARD

2
Vial apparatus with heating, 
digital timer, hot plate Chemglass CG-1997-V-250 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76333-678 $1,088.38 50-135-4670 / CG-1997-V-250 $1,099.82 NO AWARD

120 clamp holder (don't substitute) Chemglass CG-2040-C-01 no bid n/a no bid n/a 30622-652 $32.53 50-143-620 / CG-2040-C-01 $32.85 NO AWARD

4
Ring clamp to support Dewars for 
vacuum Chemglass CG-3057-10 no bid n/a 707242 $5.59 10034-446 $22.65 50 131 1211 / CG-3057-10 $22.34 NO AWARD

50
3-prong utility clamp small (don't 
substitute) Chemglass CG-9004-200 no bid n/a 707378 $45.60 21570-200 $18.58 50-131-1234/ CG-9004-200 $18.39 NO AWARD

40
3-prong utility clamp medium 
(don't substitute) Chemglass CG-9004-202 no bid n/a 707377 $13.15 21570-302 $21.68 50-131-1235/ CG-9004-202 $17.80 NO AWARD

30
3-prong utility clamp large (don't 
substitute) Chemglass CG-9004-204 no bid n/a no bid n/a 21570-404 $30.24 50-13101236 / CG-9004-204 $20.05 NO AWARD

4 Thermometer clamp Chemglass CG-9201-10 no bid n/a 707365 $15.43 10034-158 $24.53 50-131-1237 / CG-9201-10 $23.03 NO AWARD
4 chain clamp for dewar flasks Chemglass CG-9220-E-01 no bid n/a no bid n/a 10034-160 $111.42 50-131-1238 / CG-9220-E-01 $110.18 NO AWARD

3
Micropipette kit (10 uL, 100 uL, 
1000 uL-min.) Fisher F167350G (Gilson F167350) no bid n/a no bid n/a quote 8031334084 $568.41 F167350G / F167350 $741.66 NO AWARD

32 Tongs, beaker Fisher 02-620 no bid n/a 702980 $7.14 82027-374 $269.81 02-620 / 29120 $24.14 FISHER

288
Wide-Mouth Lab Quality HDPE 
Bottles, 125 mL Fisher 02-893-5C no bid n/a 716256 $1.44 no bid n/a 02-893-5C / 2104-0004 $1.64 CAROLINA

216
Wide-Mouth Lab Quality HDPE 
Bottles, 250 mL Fisher 02-893-5D no bid n/a 716257 $1.67 no bid n/a 02-893-5D / 2104-0008 $0.26 FISHER

264
Wide-Mouth Lab Quality HDPE 
Bottles, 500 mL Fisher 02-893-5E no bid n/a 716258 $2.36 no bid n/a 02-893-5E / 2104-0016 $2.92 CAROLINA

216
Wide-Mouth Lab Quality HDPE 
Bottles, 1000 mL Fisher 02-893-5F no bid n/a 716259 $4.48 no bid n/a 02-893-5F / 2104-0032 $6.06 CAROLINA

84
Narrow-Mouth Amber HDPE Lab 
Quality Bottles, 250 mL Fisher 02-923-5D no bid n/a 716314 $2.09 no bid n/a 02-923-5D / 2004-0008 $2.46 FISHER

30
Narrow-Mouth Amber HDPE Lab 
Quality Bottles, 1000 mL Fisher 02-923-5F no bid n/a 716318 $5.02 no bid n/a 02-923-5F /  2004-0032 $6.27 FISHER

216
Narrow-Mouth HDPE Lab Quality 
Bottles, 125 mL Fisher 02-923C no bid n/a 716312 $1.44 no bid n/a 02-923C / 2002-0004 $1.16 CAROLINA

288
Narrow-Mouth HDPE Lab Quality 
Bottles, 250 mL Fisher 02-923D no bid n/a 716314 $2.09 no bid n/a 02-923D / 2002-0008 $1.66 FISHER

288
Narrow-Mouth HDPE Lab Quality 
Bottles, 500 mL Fisher 02-923E no bid n/a 716314 $2.09 no bid n/a 02-923E / 2002-0016 $2.43 CAROLINA

24
Narrow-Mouth HDPE Lab Quality 
Bottles, 500 mL Fisher 02-923E no bid n/a 716314 $2.09 no bid n/a 02-023E / 2002-0016 $2.43 CAROLINA

360
Narrow-Mouth HDPE Lab Quality 
Bottles, 1000 mL Fisher 02-923F no bid n/a 716318 $5.02 no bid n/a 02-923F /  2002-0032  $4.43 FISHER

84
Wide-Mouth Lab Quality Amber 
HDPE Bottles, 250 mL Fisher 02-925-3D no bid n/a 715760 $19.33 no bid n/a 02-925-3D / 2106-0008 $3.94 FISHER

30
Wide-Mouth Lab Quality Amber 
HDPE Bottles, 1000 mL Fisher 02-925-3E no bid n/a 715762 $25.69 no bid n/a 02-025-3E /  2106-0032 $7.55 FISHER

26 Round LDPE Carboy, 10 L Fisher 02-963A no bid n/a 716391 $72.85 no bid n/a 02-963A / 2318-0020 $88.28 CAROLINA
26 Round LDPE Carboy, 20 L Fisher 02-963BB no bid n/a 716392 $86.64 no bid n/a 02-063BB / 2318-0050 $99.75 CAROLINA

144
Drop-Dispenser Bottles, Low-
Density Polyethylene, 30 mL Fisher 03-006-2 no bid n/a 716566 $3.31 no bid n/a 03-006-2 / 2411-0030 $2.53 FISHER

198
Drop-Dispenser Bottles, Low-
Density Polyethylene, 125 mL Fisher 03-006-4 no bid n/a 716568 $4.29 no bid n/a 03-006-4 / 2411-0250 $4.67 CAROLINA

54 Brush, beaker Fisher 03-555 no bid n/a 706082 $7.45 17190-007 $58.47 03-555 / BR555 $12.20 FISHER
54 Adaptable-to-Container Brush Fisher 03-565 no bid n/a 706100 $8.02 17145-063 $17.65 03-565 / BR565 $3.75 FISHER

54 Flask Brush Fisher 03-571-5 no bid n/a 706142 $4.03 17155-001 $26.20 03-571-5 / 1780 $4.33 FISHER
8 Brass Wire Brush Fisher 03-685 no bid n/a no bid n/a 30620-530 $9.54 03-685 / 1433 $13.27 VWR

138 Clamp, 2-prong flat VWR 21573-504 no bid n/a 707362 $8.82 21573-504 $548.93 02-300-206/ 916060 $25.60 NO AWARD
131 Clamp, double buret VWR 17683-258 no bid n/a 707341 $11.93 no bid n/a 02-300-213 / 916071 $47.80 CAROLINA

1 Cork stopper, 000, pk/100 Fisher 07-781A no bid n/a no bid n/a 23420-027 $7.67 07-781A /  F-07781A-000XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 00, pk/100 Fisher 07-781B no bid n/a no bid n/a 23420-050 $26.63 07-781B / F-07781B-00XXX $3.00 FISHER



1 Cork stopper, 0, pk/100 Fisher 07-781C no bid n/a 712161 $5.43 23420-071 $24.65 07-781C /  F-07781C-0XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 1, pk/100 Fisher 07-781D no bid n/a 712163 $5.59 23420-082 $7.62 07-781D /  F-07781D-1XXX  $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 2, pk/100 Fisher 07-781E no bid n/a 712165 $6.31 23420-107 $9.69 07-781E / F-07781E-2XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 3, pk/100 Fisher 07-781F no bid n/a 712167 $6.50 23420-129 $7.72 07-781F / F-07781F-3XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 4, pk/100 Fisher 07-781G no bid n/a 712169 $6.99 23420-140 $8.70 07-781G / F-07781G-4XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 5, pk/100 Fisher 07-781H no bid n/a 712171 $7.98 23420-162 $9.15 07-781H / F-07781H-5XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 6, pk/100 Fisher 07-781J no bid n/a 712173 $7.71 23420-184 $14.84 07-781J / F-07781J-6XXX $3.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 7, pk/100 Fisher 07-781K no bid n/a 712175 $9.20 23420-209 $8.61 07-781K /F-07781K-7XXX $4.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 8, pk/100 Fisher 07-781L no bid n/a 712177 $12.39 23420-220 $11.96 07-781L /F-07781L-8XXX $5.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 9, pk/100 Fisher 07-781M no bid n/a 712179 $16.87 23420-242 $16.49 07-781M / F-07781M-9XXX $6.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 10, pk/100 Fisher 07-781N no bid n/a 712181 $14.29 23420-264 $21.93 07-781N /F-07781N-10XXX $10.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 11, pk/100 Fisher 07-781P no bid n/a 712183 $18.01 23420-286 $28.47 07-781P /  F-07781P-11XXX $13.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 13, pk/100 Fisher 07-781Q no bid n/a no bid n/a 23420-322 $32.38 07-781Q / F-07781Q-12XXX $17.00 FISHER
1 Cork stopper, 14, pk/100 Fisher 07-781R no bid n/a 712187 $33.48 76293-850 $59.35 07-781R / F-07781R-13XXX $15.00 FISHER

12 Walter crucible holder Fisher 08-285 no bid n/a no bid n/a 470151-210 $36.15 08-285 / VCHWGS $8.95 FISHER

12
Dessicator, glass, 200 mm 
diameter Fisher 08-615A no bid n/a no bid n/a 25020-020 $82.81 08-615A / 683-1/P $189.20 VWR

50 Clear 12-well plate with lid Fisher 08-772-29 no bid n/a 703467 $5.40 62406-165 $119.70 08-772-29 /   353043 $1.84 FISHER
100 Clear 6-well plate with lid Fisher 08-772-33 no bid n/a 703468 $5.40 21100-002 $133.12 08-772-33 / 353934 $2.08 FISHER
10 Hanging Clips Fisher 09-682-726 no bid n/a no bid n/a 97054-324 $56.59 09-682-726 / 3869500 $4.88 FISHER

1
Liquid Nitrogen Dewar Flask, 
Nalgene, All-Plastic  HDPE, 4L Fisher 10-194-100B no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 10-194-100B / 4150-2000 $193.17 FISHER

72
Funnels, Pyrex Fluted Bowl 
150mm Stem Fisher 10-326-2C no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 10-326-2C / 6160-75 $11.98 FISHER

150 Funnel, Buchner, PP, 55 mm Fisher 10-362B no bid n/a 734624 $9.69 no bid n/a 10-362B / 4280-0550 $7.87 FISHER
78 Funnel, Buchner, PP, 70 mm Fisher 10-362C no bid n/a 734626 $11.67 no bid n/a 10-362C / 4280-0700 $10.03 FISHER

1
Liquid Nitrogen Transfer Vessel, 
5L Fisher 11-670-5A no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 11-670-5A / TY509X1 $973.26 FISHER

142 Ring Clamp Fisher 12-000-109 no bid n/a 707244 $7.22 470157-270 $5.68 12-000-109 / CH0674C $6.76 VWR
182 Ring stand Fisher 12-947-976 no bid n/a 707163 $13.19 89233-992 $49.29 12-947-976 / H18303-0005 $58.20 CAROLINA

22
Silicone Bulb-Type Safety Pipet 
Filler Fisher 13-681-102A no bid n/a 736869 $14.59 53497-053 $21.26 13-681-102A /  13 681 102A $26.28 CAROLINA

1 Rubber stopper, 00, pk/105 Fisher 14-130A no bid n/a 712400 $11.21 59580-069 $111.29 14-130A/ 00M290 $16.80 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 0, pk/77 Fisher 14-130B no bid n/a 712401 $11.21 59580-080 $100.85 14-130B / 0M290 $17.71 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 1, pk/57 Fisher 14-130C no bid n/a 712402 $11.21 59580-105 $106.63 14-130C / 1M290 $17.10 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 2, pk/52 Fisher 14-130D no bid n/a 712403 $11.21 59580-127 $108.40 14-130D /  2M290 $19.76 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 3, pk/39 Fisher 14-130E no bid n/a 712404 $11.21 59580-149 $131.02 14-130E / 3M290 $1.56 FISHER
1 Rubber stopper, 4, pk/28 Fisher 14-130F no bid n/a 712405 $11.21 59580-160 $29.75 14-130F / 4M290 $13.72 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 5, pk/28 Fisher 14-130G no bid n/a 712406 $11.21 59580-182 $142.98 14-130G / 5M290 $0.28 FISHER
1 Rubber stopper, 7, pk/15 Fisher 14-130L no bid n/a 712410 $11.21 59580-262 $132.53 14-130L / 7M290 $15.90 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 8, pk/12 Fisher 14-130M no bid n/a 712412 $11.21 59580-309 $131.86 14-130M / 8M290 $18.48 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 9, pk/10 Fisher 14-130N no bid n/a 712414 $11.21 59580-342 $148.64 14-130N / 9M290 $18.60 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 10, pk/8 Fisher 14-130P no bid n/a 712416 $11.21 59580-386 $149.33 14-130P / 10M290 $20.00 CAROLINA
1 Rubber stopper, 11, pk/6 Fisher 14-130R no bid n/a no bid n/a 59580-422 $154.79 14-130R / 11M290 $19.86 FISHER
1 Rubber stopper, 12, pk/5 Fisher 14-130T no bid n/a no bid n/a 59580-466 $177.66 14-130T / 12M290 $18.75 FISHER
1 Rubber stopper, 13, pk/4 Fisher 14-130U no bid n/a no bid n/a 59580-488 $161.23 14-130U / 13M290 $20.04 FISHER

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 00, 
pk/100 Fisher 14-135A no bid n/a 712430 $11.21 59581-120 $27.64 14-135A / 00M291 $20.71 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 0, 
pk/80 Fisher 14-135B no bid n/a 712431 $11.21 59581-141 $24.23 14-135B / 0M291 $19.20 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 1 , 
pk/59 Fisher 14-135C no bid n/a 712432 $11.21 59581-163 $27.26 14-135C /1M291 $20.06 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 2, 
pk/54 Fisher 14-135D no bid n/a 712433 $11.21 59581-185 $27.60 14-135D /2M291 $20.52 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 3, 
pk/41 Fisher 14-135E no bid n/a 712434 $11.21 59581-200 $31.58 14-135E /3M291 $19.68 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 4, 
pk/35 Fisher 14-135F no bid n/a 712435 $11.21 59581-221 $32.41 14-135F /4M291 $20.30 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 5, 
pk/29 Fisher 14-135G no bid n/a 712436 $11.21 59581-243 $36.73 14-135G / 5M291 $19.43 CAROLINA



1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 7, 
pk/15 Fisher 14-135L no bid n/a 712440 $11.21 59581-323 $35.95 14-135L /6M291 $20.25 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 8, 
pk/12 Fisher 14-135M no bid n/a 712442 $11.21 59581-367 $32.90 14-135M /7M291 $21.12 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, one-hole, 9, 
pk/10 Fisher 14-135N no bid n/a 712444 $11.21 59581-403 $31.01 14-135N / 8M291 $21.70 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 00, 
pk/113 Fisher 14-140A no bid n/a 712460 $11.21 76293-718 $4.20 14-140A / 00M292 $21.47 VWR

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 0, 
pk/82 Fisher 14-140B no bid n/a 712461 $11.21 no bid n/a 14-140B / 0M292 $19.68 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 1 , 
pk/63 Fisher 14-140C no bid n/a 712462 $11.21 76293-722 $4.20 14-140C /1M292 $19.53 VWR

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 2, 
pk/57 Fisher 14-140D no bid n/a 712463 $11.21 59582-144 $140.80 14-140D / 2M292 $21.09 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 3, 
pk/43 Fisher 14-140E no bid n/a 712464 $11.21 59582-166 $170.20 14-140E / 3M292 $0.86 FISHER

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 4, 
pk/37 Fisher 14-140F no bid n/a 712465 $11.21 59582-188 $170.85 14-140F /4M292 $19.61 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 5, 
pk/30 Fisher 14-140G no bid n/a 712466 $11.21 59582-202 $171.41 14-140G / 5M292 $23.70 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 7, 
pk/16 Fisher 14-140J no bid n/a 712470 $11.21 59582-280 $176.51 14-140J /7M292 $20.64 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 8, 
pk/13 Fisher 14-140K no bid n/a 712472 $11.21 59582-326 $161.17 14-140K / 8M292 $19.50 CAROLINA

1
Robber stopper, two-hole, 9, 
pk/11 Fisher 14-140L no bid n/a 712474 $11.21 59582-360 $171.09 14-140L / 9M292 $21.23 CAROLINA

8
Vacuum Tubing, Black, 12.7 mm 
ID, 50 ft Fisher 14-150-2H no bid n/a no bid n/a 62991-927 $198.16 14-150-2H / 08693 $163.73 FISHER

8
Vacuum Tubing, Black, 7.9 mm ID, 
50 ft Fisher 14-150-2K no bid n/a no bid n/a 62993-817 $109.65 14-150-2K /08691 $110.56 VWR

8
Vacuum Tubing, Black, 9.5 mm ID, 
50 ft Fisher 14-150-2L no bid n/a no bid n/a 62991-905 $163.25 14-150-2L /  08692  $140.31 FISHER

32
General-Purpose Rubber Tubing, 
12 ft, 6.34mm ID Fisher 14-158D no bid n/a no bid n/a 62995-670 $29.05 14-158D / 08624 $9.83 FISHER

1
Vacuum Tubing, Tygon, 1/4 in D, 
50 ft Fisher 14-171-222 no bid n/a 711525 $67.30 89404-324 $209.75 14-171-222 /  ACF00020 $230.02 VWR

1
Vacuum Tubing, Tygon, 1/2 in ID, 
50 ft Fisher 14-171-238 no bid n/a 711531 $103.21 89403-964 $462.44 14-171-238 / ACF00040 $24.00 FISHER

130 Scoopula Spatula Fisher 14-357Q no bid n/a 702851 $1.71 MSPP-14357Q $27.26 14-357Q / 20560Q $2.40 CAROLINA
362 Stir Magnet Fisher 14-513-59 no bid n/a 701092 $9.04 58948-138 $549.63 14-513-59 / 37110-5001 $2.47 FISHER

277
Nalgene™ Polypropylene-Filled 
Test Tube Peg Racks Fisher 14-810-54G no bid n/a 215570 $3.00 no bid n/a 14-810-54G / 5977-0017 $11.94 FISHER

63 Anti-Static Handle Brushes Fisher 15-078-213 no bid n/a no bid n/a 89094-718 $17.09 15-078-213 / 3322 $17.85 VWR
106 Tongs, crucible Fisher 15-200 no bid n/a 7012950 $11.89 470148-786 $4.45 15-200 / 29100 $5.47 VWR

6 Meker Burner Fisher 17-012-818 no bid n/a 706711 $19.90 470121-732 $41.85 17-012-818 / CH0996NG/RSD $61.78 VWR
2 Lecture Bottle Holder Fisher 17-989-117 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76292-546 $92.61 17-989-117 / 35322 $107.86 VWR

30 Snap-On Dust Pan and Brush Fisher 19-200-749 no bid n/a no bid n/a 10798-978 $6.98 19-200-749 /148229 $6.93 FISHER
20 5 x 8 Ring Stand 26'' high Fisher 501042880 no bid n/a 707165 $16.11 470137-824 $20.80 501042880 / MTST1/RSD  $24.26 CAROLINA

130 Bunsen burner Fisher 50-110-1233 no bid n/a 706709 $19.68 89038-536 $228.58 50-110-1233 / CH0095B/RSD $35.68 CAROLINA

34
Funnel, Buchner,  Porcelain, 55 
mm Fisher FB966C no bid n/a no bid n/a 89038-120 $19.11 FB966C / J-185 $19.44 VWR

34
Funnel, Buchner,  Porcelain, 70 
mm Fisher FB966D no bid n/a no bid n/a 89038-122 $22.42 FB966D / J-186 $28.34 VWR

16 Pipetter Stand Fisher FBESTAND no bid n/a 214618 $38.61 82024-544 $31.51 FBESTAND / 9420401 $30.55 FISHER

15
Deionized Water Labeled Wash 
Bottle, 500 ml Fisher S05129 no bid n/a 857201 $7.75 10111-948 $15.66 S05129 /F12416-0003/EMD $8.16 FISHER

78 Spectroscope Fisher S07816 no bid n/a 755319 $8.27 470016-874 $4.23 S07816 / PH100QA $4.07 FISHER
130 Burner Connecting Hose Fisher S12817 no bid n/a 706770 $31.26 470121-742 $8.05 S12817 / CH0100A  $13.87 VWR
156 Brush, test tube Fisher S13720 no bid n/a 706070 $1.44 470149-2356 $8.39 S13720 / 4-10260-10 $0.36 FISHER

171
Eisco Neoprene Bunsen Burner 
Hose, 3ft Fisher S24487 no bid n/a 706770 $31.26 470220-806 $12.74 S24487 /  CH0100B $12.68 FISHER

33 Soap Labeled Wash Bottle, 500 ml Fisher S317325 (na) no bid n/a 716609 $4.37 70690-068 $22.29 FB0340923N /  FB0340923N $2.85 FISHER



46 Rubber Policeman Fisher S66002 no bid n/a 711312 $5.62 53800-005 $23.12 S66002 / GRPL08 $0.20 FISHER
2 Fuming Hotplate Fisher S69026A no bid n/a 211980 $23.13 470020-328 $18.49 S69026A / FHP100 $18.27 FISHER
2 Portable Fuming Chamber Fisher S69028A no bid n/a no bid n/a 470019-340 $265.56 S69028A / CNA990 $202.23 FISHER

28 LaMotte Soil Test Kit Fisher S85039 (LaMotte 567901) no bid n/a no bid n/a 470007-588 $46.43 S85039 /567901 $49.62 VWR
110 Wire gauze Fisher S95948 no bid n/a 706902 $2.20 470019-506 $10.89 S95948 / CH0525A $9.90 CAROLINA

1 Beam Profiler Edmund 11-045 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD
4 NIST traceable Manometers Fisher 06-664-21 no bid n/a no bid n/a 33500-086 $189.59 06-664-21 /3462 $181.06 FISHER

1
Waterproof Cryogen Gloves, Mid-
Arm M, pair Fisher 11-394-326 no bid n/a 706500 $57.00 89426-962 $116.34 11-394-326 / MAMWP $117.98 VWR

1
Waterproof Cryogen Gloves, Mid-
Arm, XL, pair Fisher 11-394-328 no bid n/a 706501 $60.04 32884-041 $143.57 11-394-328 / MAXLWP $117.98 FISHER

1
Rubbermaid  Heavy Duty Utility 
Cart Fisher 11-926-85 no bid n/a 704781 $160.00 66005-920 $299.32 11-926-85 / FG452088BEIG $215.00 NO AWARD

11 Lab Cart Fisher 11-954-754 no bid n/a 705010 $560.00 97005-268 $182.18 11-954-754 / 322 $270.31 VWR

19
Rubbermaid™ Heavy-Duty Tray-
Shelf Carts (narrow) Fisher 19-166-523 no bid n/a 704791 $140.00 470121-816 $233.08 19-166-523 / FG450088BLA $188.93 NO AWARD

1
 Storage/Transport Chest, 2.7 Cu. 
Ft., with dolly Sonoco™ ThermoSafe, Fisher 22-024802 no bid n/a no bid n/a 73320-006 $468.93 22-024802 &11-676-24/FG4520 &37$600.00 VWR

1 Stable-Ride Single-Cylinder Trucks McMaster-Carr 2561T12 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76292-472 $346.37 no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 Pulling handle for steel dolly Mcmaster-Carr 2596T7 no bid n/a no bid n/a 19758-590 $159.90 no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 Solid-Platform Steel Dolly McMaster-Carr 2730T8 no bid n/a no bid n/a 19758-590 $159.90 no bid n/a NO AWARD
2 Single-Cylinder Hand Truck McMaster-Carr 8777T23 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76292-472 $346.37 no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 Pallet truck McMaster-Carr 9838T85 no bid n/a no bid n/a 89093-020 $758.69 no bid n/a NO AWARD

32 Clear Industrial Tote ULINE S-11866 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NC1448035 / S-11866 $84.84 NO AWARD

144
Plastic storage containers - 13 x 8 
x 5 ULINE S-15402 no bid n/a 629360 $33.45 no bid n/a NC0367074 / S-15402 $36.80 NO AWARD

120
Plastic storage containers - 16 x 12 
x 7 ULINE S-15403 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NC0708119 / S-15403 $75.71 NO AWARD

100
Plastic Storage Containers - 23 x 
16 x 6 ULINE S-18822 no bid n/a 629362 $50.00 no bid n/a NC1315202 / S-18822 $132.00 NO AWARD

100
Plastic storage Containers - 23 x 
16 x 12 ULINE S-18824 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NC0682531 / S18824 $129.60 NO AWARD

23 Digi-Melt (Mel temp app.) SRS MPA160 no bid n/a 711032 $950.00 97039-682 $4,996.00 no bid n/a NO AWARD
2 Optics Table, 4ft x 6ft, w/legs ThorLabs T46HK no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 Optics Table, 4ft x 8ft w/legs ThorLabs T48HK no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 Vacuum oven Fisher 13-261-286 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a 13-261-286 / 3608-5 $3,020.74 FISHER
9 Glassware/sample oven Fisher 15-103-0511 no bid n/a no bid n/a 89511-412 $1,826.46 15-103-0511/ 51030511 $1,718.51 FISHER
1 Gravity Glassware Oven Fisher 15-103-0521 no bid n/a no bid n/a 89511-408 $2,152.61 15-103-0521 /  51030521 $1,398.46 FISHER

1

LG Smooth Surface Freestanding  
Self-Cleaning Convection Electric 
Range LG LRE3061ST Lowes no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

7 Microwave oven Oster OGZF1301 (Target) no bid n/a no bid n/a 470309-418 $186.19 no bid n/a NO AWARD

1 Wall-Mounted Microwave Oven Whirlpool WMH53521HZ (Lowes 878061) no bid n/a no bid n/a 10147-786 $299.12 no bid n/a NO AWARD

4 Pipettor kit Fisher 14-388-100 no bid n/a SPEC23202 $414.12 76169-268 $955.59 14-388-100 / 4680100 $658.45 FISHER
10 Pipettman set 20uL Fisher FA10005MG (Gilson FA10005M) no bid n/a 214623 $98.53 76178-052 $189.47 FA10005MG / FA10005M $310.39 NO AWARD
11 Pipettman set 1000uL Fisher FA10006MG (Gilson FA10006M) no bid n/a 214629 $98.53 76178-054 $189.47 FA10006MG / FA10006M $310.39 NO AWARD

4
Thermal Printer for SPECTRONIC 
200 Fisher SS06240F no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a SS06240F / 840-234000 $666.00 FISHER

2 Refrigerator (5.5 ft3 cap.) Fisher FBV05RPSA no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a FBV054PSA / FBV05RPSA $568.21 FISHER

1

Chromatography Refrigerator - 2-
10 C, 45 ft3, glass doors, 8 
shelves, 115V Fisher FBG45CPLA no bid n/a no bid n/a 76300-160 $4,529.27 FBG45CPLA / FBG45CPLA $5,058.60 VWR

10 Refrigerator (17 ft3 cap.) Whirlpool WRR56X18FW no bid n/a no bid n/a 76314-274 $1,535.89 no bid n/a NO AWARD

11
Upright refrigerator with upper 
freezer Whirlpool WRT518SZFW (Lowes 732482) no bid n/a no bid n/a 76314-282 $2,169.56 no bid n/a NO AWARD

1
Upright refrigerator with upper 
freezer Whirlpool  WRF535SWBM no bid n/a no bid n/a 76314-282 $2,169.56 no bid n/a NO AWARD



2

Explosion-proof 
refrigerator/freezer, 10.1 cu. Ft., 
115 V 60 Hz, 1 deg. C. to 12 deg. 
C. (refrigerator), -12 deg. C to -20 
deg.C. (freezer) Fisher FBH07CESA no bid n/a n/a $4,400.00 no bid n/a FBH07CESA / $2,544.86 NO AWARD

8

Explosion-proof 
refrigerator/freezer, 10.1 cu. Ft., 
115 V 60 Hz, 1 deg. C. to 12 deg. 
C. (refrigerator), -12 deg. C to -20 
deg.C. (freezer) Fisher TSH07CESA no bid n/a n/a $4,400.00 no bid n/a Fisher TSH07CESA $2,544.86 NO AWARD

3
Heated Ultrasonic Cleaning Bath, 
9.5L, 120V, 40Hz Fisher 15-337-426 no bid n/a no bid n/a 89375-496 $1,176.61 15-336-123 / CPX-952-518R $1,017.56 FISHER

1 Automated solid-phase extraction PromoChrom SPE-03 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

5

Spectrophotometer  - double 
beam, xenon flash lamp, 190-
1100 nm minimum requirements Fisher 14-385-354 no bid n/a 653323 $2,721.75 no bid n/a 14-385-354 /  840-309000 $5,919.36 FISHER

32

American Weigh Scales 
Calibration weight for digital scale, 
Carbon steel, Chrome finish, 50g Amazon B002SVQHFQ no bid n/a 702465 $13.30 76404-666 $63.65 no bid n/a CAROLINA

2 Equal Mass Kit Classroom Set Flinn AP6147 no bid n/a no bid n/a 470230-042 $12.57 no bid n/a NO AWARD

32 Specific Gravity Specimens, set Flinn AP9235 no bid n/a 752490 $12.88 470005-426 $11.59 no bid n/a NO AWARD
1 UV Linearity Reference Set Starna RM-040812162024 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76016-848 $1,790.12 no bid n/a NO AWARD

1
Didymium Glass Wavelength 
Reference Standard Starna RM-DG no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

1
Ultrapure Water Fluorescence 
Standard Starna RM-H2O no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

1
Stray Light Reference Standard 
(Sodium Iodide) Starna RM-SI no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

2 Hotplate/Stirrer 7x7 Fisher SP88857200 no bid n/a 701038 $340.00 10027-052 $1,348.61 SP88857200/ SP88857200 $225.27 FISHER
2 Microscope Charging Cart Ken-a-Vision 300-001-000 no bid n/a no bid n/a 470013-540 $1,089.97 no bid n/a NO AWARD

3
Chromebook Secure Charging 
Station Belkin B2B117 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

1
Demonstration Size Molecular 
Model Sets Carolina Biological Supply 840155 no bid n/a 840155 $220.40 470151-958 $19.83 no bid n/a CAROLINA

100
Small Heat Sensitive Periodic 
Table Educational Innovations HEA-320 no bid n/a no bid n/a 170217-480 $50.39 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2 Spectrophotometer Fisher 14-385-491 no bid n/a 653323 $2,721.75 no bid n/a 14-385-491 / 840-281700 $2,002.69 FISHER

1
Demonstration Size Molecular 
Model Sets Flinn AP8907 no bid n/a 840150 $260.49 no bid n/a S44044/ 19V512 $229.62 FISHER

2
Electrolysis Apparatus, Brownlee, 
with Battery Jar Flinn AP9027 no bid n/a 757492 $84.36 no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

23 Science Microscope ken-a-vision T-1050 Fisher S98243 no bid n/a no bid n/a 470229-740 $109.26 no bid n/a NO AWARD
16 Centimeter Cubes Set Learning Resources LER2089 no bid n/a 971949 $26.55 no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

60
Organic Chemistry Molecular 
Model Set MegaMolecules BC120 no bid n/a no bid n/a 470232-050 $19.40 no bid n/a NO AWARD

1 Molecular Visions kit Molecular Model Kits/Kit #6 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

15 Accessories for Dynamics Systems Pasco ME-1242 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

15
2.2 m Classic Dynamics System w/ 
accessory pack Pasco ME-5713 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

15 Basic Optics System Pasco OS-8515C no bid n/a 755106 $198.59 470039-934 $113.21 no bid n/a NO AWARD
64 Vernier "Stir Station" Vernier  STIR STIR $121.26 n/a no bid 470017-590 $117.99 S165056ND / STIR $123.05 VWR
20 Force Plate Vernier FP-BTA FP-BTA $274.55 no bid n/a 470002-958 $268.49 S16152ND /FP-BTA $276.11 VWR
4 Pressure Sensor Vernier GPS-BTA no bid - not needed n/a no bid n/a 470001-858 $79.63 S16052ND / GPS-BTA $84.99 NO AWARD
4 Logger Pro® 3 Vernier LP LP $0.00 no bid n/a 470120-710 $237.49 S16053ND / LP $235.17 NO AWARD

4
LabQuest 2 Chemistry Standard 
Package Vernier LQ2-CH-DX LQ2-CH-DX $918.00 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a VERNIER

4 pH sensor Vernier PH-BTA PH-BTA $88.00 no bid n/a 470039-294 $84.03 S16238ND / PH-BTA $83.98 NO AWARD



4 Voltage probe Vernier VP-BTA VP-BTA $11.64 no bid n/a 470017-076 $11.61 S16072ND /VP-BTA $11.46 NO AWARD
1 Emission spectrometer Vernier VSP-EM VSP-EM $799.00 no bid n/a 470016-640 $776.59 S16283ND / VSP-EM $763.37 FISHER

1
Fiber, Accessory for Vernier 
Spectrometer Vernier VSP-EM-FIBER VSP-EM-FIBER $88.00 no bid n/a 470116-642 $86.12 S16284ND / VSP-EM-FIBER $83.11 FISHER

44

Digital Thermometer with 
Stainless-Steel Stem and .025 in. 
LCD screen Fisher 06-664-35 no bid n/a 745360 $15.81 37000-414 $45.56 06-664-35 / 4369 $40.29 FISHER

144
Waterproof Food Thermometer 
with Holders Fisher 14-649-101 no bid n/a no bid n/a 36934-168 $26.12 14-649-101 / 4421 $23.43 FISHER

8 6-in C-Clamp Lowes (IRWIN) 1901235 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76293-518 $5.54 no bid n/a NO AWARD
4 8-in C-Clamp Lowes (IRWIN) 1901236 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

2

20-Piece Plastic Handle 
Screwdriver Set, 6 Phillips, 6 flat 
tips, 2 Torx drive, 1 square drive, 1 
off-set, 3 hooks, 1 pick Lowes (Kobalt) 324GC20N no bid n/a no bid n/a 76188-622 $205.33 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2

5-Piece Plastic Handle Torx Multi-
Bit Screwdriver Set, hardened and 
tempered steel blades, nickel 
plated Lowes (Kobalt) 324TX5CN no bid n/a no bid n/a 10058-844 $53.99 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
3-Piece Adjustable Wrench Set, 6-
in, 8-in, and 10-in Lowes (Kobalt) 55748 no bid n/a no bid n/a 300003-166 $99.04 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2

5-piece Assorted Traditional Plier 
Set - log nose, diagonal, slip joint, 
linesman, and groove joint.  Drop-
forged chrome nickel steel Lowes (Kobalt) 55754 no bid n/a no bid n/a 470110-726 $16.85 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2 18-in Cast Iron Pipe Wrench Lowes (Kobalt) 55773 no bid n/a no bid n/a 300003-516 $47.92 no bid n/a NO AWARD
2 10-in Cast Iron Pipe Wrench Lowes (Kobalt) 55775 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76190-920 $629.39 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
8-ft Fiberglass Type 1 - 250 lbs. 
Capacity Step Ladder Lowes (Werner) 6008S no bid n/a no bid n/a 300008-935 $193.48 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2 20-key Metric/SAE Hex Key Set Lowes (Craftsman) CMHT26000 no bid n/a no bid n/a 300019-154 $55.33 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
22-oz Milled Face Steel Head Steel 
Framing Hammer Lowes (Craftsman) CMHT51435 no bid n/a no bid n/a 500013-080 $13.09 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
Precision 10-Piece Bi-Material 
Handle Screwdriver Set Lowes (Craftsman) CMHT65070 no bid n/a no bid n/a 300004-062 $39.53 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2

150-Piece Standard (SAE) and 
Metric Gunmetal Chrome 
Mechanics Tool Set Lowes (Craftsman) CMMT12035 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76191-326 $2,443.17 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
 26-in W x 19.75-in H 5-Drawer 
Steel Tool Chest (Red) Lowes (Craftsman) CMST22652RB no bid n/a no bid n/a 300020-384 $674.07 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
26.5-in W x 34-in H 5-Drawer 
Steel Rolling Tool Cabinet (Red) Lowes (Craftsman) CMST22752RB no bid n/a no bid n/a 300020-384 $674.07 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
20-Volt Max 1/2-in Brushless 
Cordless Drill (Charger Included) Lowes (DEWALT) DCD777C2 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
24-oz Smooth Face Steel Head 
Rubber Ball Peen Hammer Lowes (Estwing) E3-24BP no bid n/a no bid n/a 300023-848 $40.20 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
True RMS Clamp Meter Digital 
600-Volt Multimeter Test Meter Lowes FLUKE-110 PLUS-LW no bid n/a no bid n/a 10171-850 $171.21 no bid n/a NO AWARD

2 4-Piece Household Tool Set Lowes (Channellock) GS-3S no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
64-oz Smooth Face Steel Head 
Steel Blacksmith Hammer Lowes (Estwing) MRF64BS no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

2
Enhanced-Visibility LED Weighted-
Base Workstation Magnifier McMaster-Carr 1462T23 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76251-612 $171.28 no bid n/a NO AWARD

8 UV Lamp, handheld Fisher UVP95000505 no bid n/a 211900 $34.85 no bid n/a UVP95000505 /95-0005-05 $233.00 FISHER

4 Solvent trap for vacuum pumps Chemglass CG-4515-03 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80072-552 $125.20 CG451503 /CG-4515-03 $104.13 FISHER

4 Vacuum controller, J-KEM digital Chemglass CG-4600-01 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80063-118 $1,461.56 CG460001 /CG-4600-01 $1,332.39 NO AWARD



1 Vaccum oven (1.7 cu. Ft.) Chemglass CLS-3450-217 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76414-868 $4,989.69 50-143-536/ CLS-3450-217 $7,140.00 VWR

5
Vaccum pump, belt driven, 300 
L/min Chemglass (Welch) AF-0350-03 no bid n/a no bid n/a 80060-100 $4,154.55 AF035003 /  AF-0350-03 $4,294.75 VWR

8 Vortex Mixer
Scientific Industries VORTEX-GENIE 2, Corning 
LSE no bid n/a 701077 $190.00 58815-234 $289.89 10-320-807 /6775 $148.00 FISHER

7 Lab Glassware Washer Fisher 10-359-108 no bid n/a n/a $10,500.00 97001-156 $11,874.30 10-359-108 / 4420320 $7,139.81 FISHER

1
5-cu. Ft. High Efficiency Stackable 
Steam Cycle Front -Load Washer Lowes (Samsung) 1414875 no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

1
7.5 cu.ft. stackable steam cycle 
electric dryer, ENERGY STAR Samsung #DVE45R6300C no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a no bid n/a NO AWARD

1 Cooler Bath Andwin Scientific BBL301 no bid n/a no bid n/a 75876-018 $4,410.74 13-847-895 /1525258 $3,439.07 FISHER

1
Small water bath - 5L, ambient to 
95 C Fisher FSGPD05 no bid n/a 216266 $734.58 76308-834 $373.84 FSGPD05 / FSGPD05 $0.00 VWR

3
Water Bath (10L) - 10 L, ambient 
to 100 C Fisher FSGPD10 no bid n/a no bid n/a 76308-896 $437.94 FSGPD10 / FSGPD10 $599.76 VWR

3 Precision water bath Fisher TSGP10 no bid n/a 216278 $998.84 no bid n/a TSGP10 / TSGP10 $862.79 FISHER


	Totals

