Department / Requisition: Warehouse / 142634159
Description of Bid: Air Filters

Opening Date: 4/22/2021

Prepared by: Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to

Fastenal Total Filtration Services Puremaxx LLC.
Part Code |Description Filter Type Estimated Usage Bid Price / EA EXT PRICE Shipping / Discount Bid Price / EA EXT PRICE Shipping / Discount Bid Price / EA EXT PRICE Shipping / Discount
28001 A/CFILTER-191/8x87/8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 125 6.20 775.00 Séigf:r;dssxiz:jalood?yf s 185 23125 S:J:td:r:‘dssilzeer':;:osd‘fv‘f S 279| ¢ 348.75 1228;5?7 p;:; ifd/ayzle/al:;\:
20 days / Cartridge - 45 days
28002 A/CFILTER-241/8x87/8x1 Regular Fiberglass 65 6.56 426.40 S 2.00 130.00 $ 279 $ 181.35
28003 A/CFILTER-335/8x87/8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 228 6.96 1,586.88 $ 2.10 478.80 $ 813 $ 1,853.64
28004 A/CFILTER-421/8x87/8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 8 11.09 88.72 $ 332 26.56 $ 850( $ 68.00
28006 A/CFILTER-611/8x87/8x1 Regular Fiberglass 8 14.28 114.24 S 3.74 29.92 S 11.89( $ 95.12
28008 A/CFILTER-191/2X93/4X 1 Regular Fiberglass 15 6.20 93.00 $ 1.85 27.75 $ 279 $ 4185
28010 A/CFILTER-12x12x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 263 5.26 $ 163 3.26 $ 197| $ 3.94
28030 A/CFILTER- 16 x83/4 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 4 591 23.64 $ 163 6.52 $ 279 $ 11.16
28040 A/CFILTER- 16 x 16 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 24 3.00 72.00 $ 2.10 50.40 $ 2.14| % 51.36
28050 A/CFILTER-18x 13 1/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 1 6.56 6.56 $ 2.00 2.00 $ 279 $ 2.79
28060 A/CFILTER- 18 x 16 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 4 6.96 27.84 $ 2.10 8.40 $ 279 $ 11.16
28070 A/CFILTER-19x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 34 6.20 210.80 $ 1.85 62.90 $ 279 $ 94.86
28080 A/CFILTER-19x83/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 81 6.20 502.20 $ 1.85 149.85 $ 279 $ 225.99
28082 A/CFILTER-19x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 6 5.84 35.04 $ 1.85 11.10 $ 279 $ 16.74
28090 A/CFILTER-20x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 218 6.20 1,351.60 $ 1.85 40330 $ 279 $ 608.22
28100 A/CFILTER-20x 10 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 2.70 5.40 $ 2.00 4.00 $ 279 $ 5.58
28110 A/CFILTER-20x 14 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 257 5.14 $ 2.10 4.20 $ 279 $ 5.58
28120 A/CFILTER-20 x 16 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 12 233 27.96 $ 2.29 27.48 $ 294| % 35.28
28130 A/CFILTER-20x 20 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 38 252 95.76 $ 2.47 93.86 $ 238 $ 90.44
28140 A/CFILTER-21x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 10 6.20 62.00 $ 1.85 18.50 $ 279 $ 27.90
28150 A/CFILTER-21x18x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 738 14.76 $ 2.29 4.58 $ 295 $ 5.90
28160 A/CFILTER-211/4x81/2x 1 Regular Fiberglass 22 6.20 136.40 $ 191 42,02 $ 279 $ 61.38
28168 A/CFILTER-211/2x161/2x 1 Regular Fiberglass 84 738 619.92 $ 2.29 192.36 $ 294| % 246.96




28170 A/CFILTER-211/2x17x1 Regular Fiberglass 4 738 $ 29.52 2.00| $ 8.00 2.94 11.76
28180 A/CFILTER-213/4x71/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 620 $ 12.40 185| $ 3.70 2.79 5.58
28190 A/CFILTER-233/4x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.56 | $ 13.12 191 $ 3.82 2.79 5.58
28192 A/CFILTER-213/4x91/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.48| $ 12.96 2.00| $ 4.00 2.79 5.58
28200 A/CFILTER-24x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 620 $ 12.40 185| $ 3.70 2.79 5.58
28210 A/CFILTER-24x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 216 6.56 | $ 1,416.96 200 $ 432.00 2.79 602.64
28220 A/CFILTER-24x12x1 Regular Fiberglass 12 270 $ 32.40 210| $ 25.20 2.79 33.48
28230 A/CFILTER-24x14x 1 Regular Fiberglass 102 3.00 $ 306.00 229§ 233.58 2.94 299.88
28240 A/CFILTER-24x22x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 9.06| $ 18.12 271 $ 5.42 2.95 5.90




28260 A/CFILTER - 24 3/4x 83/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 300 6.30 1,890.00 2.00 600.00 2.79 837.00
28270 A/CFILTER-25x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 14 6.18 86.52 2.00 28.00 2.79 39.06
28280 A/CFILTER-25x16x 1 Regular Fiberglass 118 2,52 297.36 247 291.46 2.94 346.92
28281 A/CFILTER-253/4x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 92 6.55 602.60 2.00 184.00 2.79 256.68
28282 A/CFILTER-253/4x9 1/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.96 13.92 2.00 4.00 2.79 5.58
28290 A/CFILTER-25x20x 1 Regular Fiberglass 24 274 65.76 271 65.04 2.94 70.56
28300 A/CFILTER-25x25x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 3.27 6.54 2.87 5.74 3.08 6.16
28305 A/CFILTER-251/2x18x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 8.60 17.20 248 4.96 2.95 5.90
28310 A/CFILTER-253/4x7 1/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.20 12.40 1.85 3.70 2.79 5.58
28320 A/CFILTER-26x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 90 6.15 553.50 2.00 180.00 2.79 251.10
28325 A/CFILTER-26x123/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 7.38 14.76 229 4.58 295 5.90
28335 A/CFILTER-27x83/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.96 13.92 2.00 4.00 2.79 5.58
28340 A/CFILTER-27x10x 1 Regular Fiberglass 7 6.96 48.72 2.10 14.70 2.79 19.53
28350 A/CFILTER-271/8x231/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 11.24 2248 2.87 5.74 3.08 6.16
28360 A/CFILTER-271/2x8x1 Regular Fiberglass 16 6.56 104.96 2.00 32.00 2.79 44.64
28370 A/CFILTER-28x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 283 6.56 1,856.48 2.00 566.00 2.79 789.57
28380 A/CFILTER-28x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.96 13.92 2.10 4.20 2.79 5.58
28400 A/CFILTER-287/8x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.96 13.92 1.82 3.64 2.79 5.58
28410 A/CFILTER-30x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 18 3.69 66.42 2.00 36.00 2.79 50.22
28420 A/CFILTER-30x 16 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 4.82 9.64 2.47 4.94 295 5.90
28430 A/CFILTER-30x17x 1 Regular Fiberglass 24 9.60 230.40 271 65.04 294 70.56
28440 A/CFILTER-30x171/2x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 9.60 19.20 271 5.42 295 5.90
28450 A/CFILTER-30x20x 1 Regular Fiberglass 14 5.55 77.70 2.87 40.18 3.08 43.12
28460 A/CFILTER-313/4x71/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 30 6.56 196.80 2.00 60.00 8.12 243.60
28470 A/CFILTER-313/4x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 5 6.96 34.80 2.10 10.50 8.12 40.60
28475 A/CFILTER-311/2x93/8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.96 13.92 2.10 4.20 8.12 16.24
28480 A/CFILTER-32x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 234 6.64 1,553.76 1.85 432.90 8.12 1,900.08




28490 A/CFILTER-321/2x81/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 8 6.96 55.68 2.10 16.80 8.12 64.96
28500 A/CFILTER-33x10x 1 Regular Fiberglass 4 7.38 29.52 229 9.16 8.50 34.00
28510 A/CFILTER-331/2x8x1 Regular Fiberglass 8 6.96 55.68 2.10 16.80 8.12 64.96
28515 A/CFILTER-331/2x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 60 7.38 442.80 229 137.40 8.50 510.00
28517 A/CFILTER - 333/4x83/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 12 6.96 83.52 2.10 25.20 8.12 97.44
28520 A/CFILTER-34x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 12 6.96 83.52 2.10 25.20 8.12 97.44
28530 A/CFILTER-351/2x8x1 Regular Fiberglass 14 6.96 97.44 2.10 29.40 8.12 113.68
28540 A/CFILTER-361/2x8x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 6.96 13.92 2.10 4.20 8.12 16.24
28550 A/CFILTER-36 1/2x91/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 15 7.38 110.70 332 49.80 8.50 127.50
28560 A/CFILTER-361/2x10x 1 Regular Fiberglass 30 7.38 221.40 332 99.60 8.50 255.00
28570 A/CFILTER-367/8x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 10 7.38 73.80 332 33.20 8.50 85.00
28575 A/CFILTER-381/2X101/2X 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 11.07 22.14 332 6.64 8.50 17.00




28580 A/CFILTER-383/4x131/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 36 9.60 345.60 3.74 134.64 8.50 306.00
28595 A/CFILTER-393/4X 113/4X 1 Regular Fiberglass 4 8.60 34.40 3.50 14.00 8.50 34.00
28610 A/CFILTER-411/2x7 1/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 11.09 22.18 332 6.64 8.50 17.00
28620 A/CFILTER-411/2x131/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 14.40 28.80 3.74 7.48 8.50 17.00
28630 A/CFILTER-42x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 18 11.09 199.62 332 59.76 8.50 153.00
28632 A/CFILTER-42X9X 1 Regular Fiberglass 108 11.09 1,197.72 332 358.56 8.50 918.00
28634 A/CFILTER- 42 1/4 X83/4 X1 Regular Fiberglass 36 11.09 399.24 332 119.52 8.50 306.00
28640 A/CFILTER-431/2x71/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 11.09 22.18 332 6.64 8.50 17.00
28650 A/CFILTER-431/2x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 40 11.09 443.60 332 132.80 8.50 340.00
28652 A/CFILTER-433/4X71/2X1 Regular Fiberglass 102 10.75 1,096.50 332 338.64 8.50 867.00
28655 A/CFILTER-433/4x83/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 12 11.09 133.08 332 39.84 8.50 102.00
28680 A/CFILTER-44x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 148 10.75 1,591.00 332 491.36 8.50 1,258.00
28690 A/CFILTER-44x 14 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 16.87 33.74 4.01 8.02 8.96 17.92
28700 A/CFILTER-44x 15 3/4x 1 Regular Fiberglass 10 16.86 168.60 4.05 40.50 8.96 89.60
28710 A/CFILTER-46x11x1 Regular Fiberglass 190 13.90 2,641.00 3.73 708.70 8.50 1,615.00
28720 A/CFILTER-47 1/4x8x 1 Regular Fiberglass 48 11.09 532.32 332 159.36 8.50 408.00
28735 A/CFILTER- 47 3/4X 11 3/4X 1 Regular Fiberglass 4 14.40 57.60 3.73 14.92 8.50 34.00
28740 A/CFILTER-481/2x91/2x1 Regular Fiberglass 78 12.89 1,005.42 3.50 273.00 8.50 663.00
28750 A/CFILTER-51x73/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 11.09 22.18 3.32 6.64 8.50 17.00
28760 A/CFILTER-531/2x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 52 14.40 748.80 3.50 182.00 8.50 442.00
28770 A/CFILTER-531/2x131/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 16 19.26 308.16 4.29 68.64 8.50 136.00
28780 A/CFILTER-541/2x81/2x 1 Regular Fiberglass 4 12.89 51.56 3.50 14.00 8.50 34.00
28790 A/CFILTER-571/2x71/2 x1 Regular Fiberglass 46 12.75 586.50 3.50 161.00 8.50 391.00
28800 A/CFILTER-58 x 10 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 2 14.40 28.80 3.74 7.48 8.50 17.00
28810 A/CFILTER-58 x 11 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 68 16.86 1,146.48 4.02 273.36 8.50 578.00
28830 A/CFILTER-60x 11 x 1 Regular Fiberglass 6 16.86 101.16 4.02 24.12 8.96 53.76
28840 A/CFILTER-61x83/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 36 14.40 518.40 3.73 134.28 8.96 322.56




28842 A/CFILTER-61x9x 1 Regular Fiberglass 120 14.10 1,692.00 3.73| $ 447.60 11.89 1,426.80
28845 A/CFILTER-62x10x 1 Regular Fiberglass 6 16.86 101.16 4.02| $ 24.12 11.89 71.34
28850 A/CFILTER-651/2x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 68 14.40 979.20 738 $ 501.84 11.89 808.52
28860 A/CFILTER-70x 11x 1 Regular Fiberglass 68 18.50 1,258.00 8.05| $ 547.40 12.54 852.72
28870 A/CFILTER-77 1/2x9x1 Regular Fiberglass 16 16.86 269.76 8.05| $ 128.80 12.54 200.64
28880 A/CFILTER-771/2x131/4x1 Regular Fiberglass 2 26.46 52.92 976 $ 19.52 12.55 25.10
29005 PLEATED FILTER-20x81/2x 1 Pleated 12 6.20 74.40 529 $ 63.48 4.38 52.56
29007 PLEATED FILTER-22x20x 1 Pleated 2 8.10 16.20 3.75| $ 7.50 3.88 7.76
29010 PLEATED FILTER- 16 x 15x 2 Pleated 12 9.27 111.24 582 $ 69.84 6.30 75.60
29020 PLEATED FILTER- 16 x 16 x 2 Pleated 8 291 23.28 332 $ 26.56 2.79 2232
29025 PLEATED FILTER - 17 3/4x 17 3/4 x 2 Pleated 6 3.27 19.62 678 $ 40.68 6.57 39.42
29030 PLEATED FILTER-191/2x 16 1/2x 2 Pleated 16 16.62 265.92 678 $ 108.48 6.57 105.12




29040 PLEATED FILTER-191/2x191/2x2 Pleated 16 2.54 40.64 7.53 120.48 6.57 105.12
29045 PLEATED FILTER-20x 14 x 2 Pleated 4 2,57 10.28 297 11.88 2.72 10.88
29050 PLEATED FILTER- 20 x 16 x 2 Pleated 820 212 1,738.40 229 1,877.80 2.19 1,795.80
29060 PLEATED FILTER- 20 x 20 x 2 Pleated 560 2.25 1,260.00 2.66 1,489.60 2,62 1,467.20
29070 PLEATED FILTER-24x 12x 2 Pleated 350 231 808.50 274 959.00 243 850.50
29080 PLEATED FILTER-24 x 16 x 2 Pleated 8 2.85 22.80 321 25.68 4.65 37.20
29090 PLEATED FILTER - 24 x 20 x 2 Pleated 470 2.82 1,325.40 3.62 1,701.40 2.75 1,292.50
29100 PLEATED FILTER - 24 x 24 x 2 Pleated 661 2.84 1,877.24 3.60 2,379.60 4.99 3,298.39
29110 PLEATED FILTER-25x 12x 2 Pleated 4 11.43 45.72 6.78 27.12 6.57 26.28
29120 PLEATED FILTER-25x 16 x 2 Pleated 191 240 458.40 2.60 496.60 2.58 492.78
29130 PLEATED FILTER - 25x 20 x 2 Pleated 24 2.85 68.40 3.15 75.60 4.32 103.68
29140 PLEATED FILTER - 25x 25x 2 Pleated 2 3.84 7.68 4.66 9.32 5.90 11.80
29150 PLEATED FILTER- 26 1/2x81/2x 1 Pleated 12 6.56 78.72 5.66 67.92 4.62 55.44
29160 PLEATED FILTER-321/2x81/2x 1 Pleated 372 NO BID - 10.59 3,939.48 9.40 3,496.80
29170 PLEATED FILTER- 361/2x81/2x 1 Pleated 36 NO BID - 10.59 381.24 9.40 338.40
29175 PLEATED FILTER-24x 12x 4 Pleated 6 537 3222 4.90 29.40 4.74 28.44
29180 PLEATED FILTER- 20 X16 X 4 Pleated 106 5.45 577.70 4.74 502.44 5.02 532.12
29190 PLEATED FILTER-24 X 20 X 4 Pleated 90 7.00 630.00 6.75 607.50 6.56 590.40
29210 PLEATED FILTER-25x 16 x 4 Pleated 72 591 425.52 5.29 380.88 5.71 411.12
29215 PLEATED FILTER - 25x 20 x 4 Pleated 8 6.94 55.52 6.37 50.96 6.46 51.68
29220 PLEATED FILTER - 25x 24 x 4 Pleated 3 34.79 104.37 16.93 50.79 25.16 75.48
29510 POLY FILTER - 20 x 16 Poly 100 3.47 347.00 3.63 363.00 3.36 336.00
29520 POLY FILTER - 20 x 20 Poly 119 3.82 454.58 4.09 486.71 375 446.25
29530 POLY FILTER - 24 x 24 Poly 2 5.30 10.60 4.90 9.80 4.65 9.30
29540 POLY FILTER - 25 x 16 Poly 20 4.20 84.00 4.16 83.20 375 75.00
29550 POLY FILTER - 25 x 20 Poly 10 4.94 49.40 4.50 45.00 4.22 42.20
29560 POLY FILTER - 25 x 25 Poly 2 6.02 12.04 5.10 10.20 4.95 9.90




29580 POLY FILTER - 30 x 17 Poly 2 NO BID $ - 7.06( $ 14.12 15.97 31.94
29590 POLY FILTER - 30 x 20 Poly 8 7.85| $ 62.80 591 $ 47.28 12.30 98.40
29600 POLY FILTER - 30 x 24 Poly 2 10.40( $ 20.80 9.28( $ 18.56 14.76 29.52
29603 POLY FILTER- 30X 16 Poly 4 7.85| $ 31.40 751 $ 30.04 9.85 39.40
29605 POLY FILTER- 34 X 25 Poly 2 1169 $ 23.38 820 $ 16.40 7.53 15.06
29610 POLY FILTER - 40 x 20 Poly 2 9.65| $ 19.30 813 $ 16.26 7.53 15.06
29620 POLY FILTER - 50 x 16 Poly 16 9.65| $ 154.40 813 $ 130.08 7.53 120.48
29630 POLY FILTER - 50 x 25 Poly 12 14.40( $ 172.80 1393| $ 167.16 9.87 118.44
29635 POLY FILTER- 60 X 24 Poly 8 16.77( $ 134.16 13.00| $ 104.00 12.65 101.20
29640 POLY FILTER - 60 x 25 Poly 6 17.69 $ 106.14 1325| $ 79.50 12.65 75.90
29650 POLY FILTER - 64 x 16 Poly 4 1568 $ 62.72 1313 $ 52.52 10.05 40.20
29655 POLY FILTER- 66 X 20 Poly 4 16.77( $ 67.08 1246 $ 49.84 13.37 53.48




29657 POLY FILTER- 66 X 24 Poly 8 NO BID $ - 16.93| $ 135.44 1452| $ 116.16
29660 POLY FILTER - 68 x 20 Poly 2 NO BID $ - 1246 $ 24.92 1337| $ 26.74
29670 POLY FILTER - 68 x 25 Poly 2 NO BID $ - 1399 $ 27.98 15.05| $ 30.10
29690 POLY FILTER - 80 x 20 Poly 2 1914 $ 38.28 16.13| $ 32.26 15.05| $ 30.10
29700 POLY FILTER - 80 x 25 Poly 2 2354 $ 47.08 17.68| $ 35.36 16.85| $ 33.70
29705 POLY FILTER- 88 X 25 Poly 8 27.00( $ 216.00 1865 $ 149.20 18.79( $ 150.32
29720 POLY FILTER - 108 x 25 Poly 6 35.18( $ 211.08 3799 $ 227.94 21.06| $ 126.36
29730 POLY FILTER - 110 x 16 Poly 24 26.06 | $ 625.44 3506 $ 841.44 2052 $ 492.48
29732 POLY FILTER- 112X 25 Poly 8 3356 $ 268.48 3799 $ 303.92 2632 S 210.56
29733 POLY FILTER- 36 X 24 Poly 2 1112 $ 2224 831| $ 16.62 776 $ 15.52
30010 ROLL FILTER - 22 1/4 x 1 (POLY) Roll 1 NO BID $ - 153.12| $ 153.12 114.05| $ 114.05
30020 ROLL FILTER - 21 7/8 x 3 (POLY) Roll 1 NO BID $ - 134.98| $ 134.98 93.75| $ 93.75
30030 ROLL FILTER - 24 7/8 x 1 (POLY) Roll 2 NO BID $ - 139.98| $ 279.96 118.89| $ 237.78
30040 ROLL FILTER - 31 7/8 x 1 (POLY) Roll 1 NO BID $ - 151.62| $ 151.62 12619 $ 126.19
30050 ROLL FILTER - 34 5/8 x 2 (POLY) Roll 2 NO BID $ - 158.71| $ 317.42 141.09| $ 282.18
30060 ROLL FILTER - 31 7/8 x 3 (POLY) Roll 6 NO BID $ - 151.62| $ 909.72 118.93| $ 713.58
30070 ROLL FILTER - 38 1/2 x 1 (POLY) Roll 2 NO BID $ - 181.03| $ 362.06 140.73| $ 281.46
30080 ROLL FILTER - 43 7/8 x 3 (POLY) Roll 13 NO BID $ - 17849/ $ 2,320.37 144.09| $ 1,873.17
30090 ROLL FILTER - 44 3/4 x 1 (POLY) Roll 6 NO BID $ - 181.33| § 1,087.98 152.86| $ 917.16
30100 ROLL FILTER - 46 5/8 x 2 (POLY) Roll 2 NO BID $ - 185.48| $ 370.96 167.82| $ 335.64
30120 ROLL FILTER - 55 7/8 x 3 (POLY) Roll 3 NO BID $ - 20871 $ 626.13 169.26| $ 507.78
30130 ROLL FILTER - 56 3/4 x 1 (POLY) Roll 14 NO BID $ - 21120| $ 2,956.80 179.57| $ 2,513.98
30140 ROLL FILTER - 58 5/8 x 2 (POLY) Roll 3 NO BID $ - 21568 $ 647.04 194.47| $ 583.41
30150 ROLL FILTER - 70 5/8 x 2 (POLY) Roll 2 NO BID $ - 246.01 $ 492.02 22117 § 44234
30160 ROLL FILTER - 67 7/8 x 3 (POLY) Roll 1 NO BID $ - 23922 239.22 194.42| $ 194.42
30510 ;QZT:C'CD:SE ;'::f;::;: EZ:: X12 - Single Header, Cartridge 6 88.51| $ 531.06 6831 $ 409.86 56.77 $ 340.62
30520 CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 12 x 12 - Single Header, Cartridge 6 4846 $ 290.76 51.06| $ 306.36 2327 $ 259.62

Side Access Gasket, 65% Eff




CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 20 x 12- Single Header, .

30530 Side Access Gasket, 65% Eff Cartridge 22 8549 $ 1,880.78 67.66| $ 1,488.52 59.06| $ 1,299.32
CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 24 x 12- Single Header, .

30540 Side Access Gasket, 65% Eff Cartridge 11 69.06| $ 759.66 74.78| $ 822.58 6133| $ 674.63
CARTRIDGE FILTER 20 X 20 X 4 - Legacy-

30550 Header/Lip Required Ultra 4, Merv 11 (60-65%), Cartridge 14 61.56 | $ 861.84 53.29| $ 746.06 56.45| $ 790.30
Plastic Single HDR Frame




CARTRIDGE FILTER 24 X 20 X 4 - Legacy-

30560 Header/Lip Required, Ultra 4, Merv 11 (60-65%), Cartridge 18 62.45 1,124.10 55.99 1,007.82 59.22 1,065.96
Plastic Single HDR Frame
CARTRIDGE FILTER 24 X 24 X 4 - Legacy-

30570 Header/Lip Required, Ultra 4, MERV 11 (60- Cartridge 1 64.97 64.97 62.74 62.74 65.19 65.19
65%). Plastic Single HDR Frame
CARTRIDGE FILTER 12 X 24 X 12- Galv. Frame,

30575 No Header, Foam Gasket Downstream (Air Exit Cartridge 3 53.16 159.48 44.79 13437 43.71 13113
Side) ** Must have 2 Soring Clios Holes on Both
CARTRIDGE FILTER 24 X 20 X 12- Galv. Frame,

30580 No Header, Foam Gasket Downstream Side (Air Cartridge 12 73.77 885.24 64.15 769.80 59.49 713.88
Exit Side) **Must have 2 Soring Clios Holes on

30700 REGULAR FILTER-193/4X211/2X 1 Regular Fiberglass 24 8.60 206.40 2.59 62.16 7.41 177.84
CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 12 x 12- Single Header, .

30585 Side Access Gasket, MERV 15 Eff Cartridge 66 53.13 3,506.58 71.26 4,703.16 45.23 2,985.18
CARTRIDGE FILTER - 24 x 24 x 12- Single Header, .

30590 Side Access Gasket, MERV 15 Eff Cartridge 168 76.07 12,779.76 108.97 18,306.96 63.09 10,599.12
Materials at List Price % Discount 30% 0% 50%

TOTAL 71,455.80 70,187.72 70,759.65

Intent to award: 4/24/2021

Note to Bidders: If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above

within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date. After that time, additional information may be requested

by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us




