
   

Item 
Estimated 

Annual Usage
Unit Warehouse Part 

Number
Item Description Vendor Part 

Number
Unit Price Ext. Price Notes

Vendor Part 

Number
Unit Price Ext. Price Notes

WAREHOUSE PARTS LIST

1 12 EA 34001 ELZS8WSSP Wtr Fill Station 99772084 $1,829.92 $21,959.04 ELZS8WSSP $1,940.38 $23,284.56

2 5 EA 34005 CLOSET BOWL - WALL MOUNT, 4 HOLE K4325-0  #ZURZ5615BWL $115.00 $575.00  NO BID Z5615BWL $115.00 $575.00

3 10 EA 34010
TOILET BOWL- 1.1/1.6 GAL/FLUSH- ELONGATED BOWL-WHITE- 

#AMS2234001020
$96.93 $969.30  NO BID 2234001020 $96.93 $969.30

4 8 EA 34015 LAVATORY - WALL HUNG 20" X 18" 3H ADA WM 4 CC- #PF5514WH $68.18 $545.44  NO BID 035501202U $68.18 $545.44

5 4 EA 34023 KOHLER- 1/8-1.0 gallons Urinal- K4991-ET-0 (WHITE)-#ZURZ5755 $236.40 $945.60  NO BID Z5755 $236.40 $945.60

6 4 EA 34023 KOHLER- 1/8-1.0 gallons Urinal- K4991-ET-0 (WHITE)-#ZURZ5755 $236.40 $945.60  NO BID Z5755 $236.40 $945.60

7 5 EA 34025 WATER COOLER - ELKAY-  EZS8L  - #EE258L 99014832 $806.48 $4,032.40 E258L $938.91 $4,694.55

8 50 EA 42010 COMPRESSION COUPLING - 3/8" BRASS- #440407-131280 71761 $1.67 $83.50 626C $1.66 $83.00

9 40 EA 42080 LOSET SUPPLY - 3/8" X 3/8" 30" STAINLESS FLEX- LSFC530PP $7.00 $280.00  NO BID SFC530PP $7.00 $280.00

10 10 EA 42085 LF LAV SUPPLY - 1/2" X 3/8" X 20"  FLEX BRAIDED SS- #146474 70155 $4.96 $49.60 SFC120PP $3.01 $30.10

11 250 EA 42093 TOILET REPAIR KIT 3.5 GPF-    #P6000-ECR-WS-RK 99316245 $14.89 $3,722.50
PG000ECRW

S
$24.20 $6,050.00

12 12 EA 42183 LAVATORY CHROME SINGLE HANDLE FAUCET 500-DST-  #500-DST 77207 $109.34 $1,312.08 500DST $140.00 $1,680.00

13 30 EA 42245
FLUSH VALVE - ZURN MODEL 186 XL  3/4" URINAL- #ZURZ6003YBYC-  

#3082653
48892 $109.82 $3,294.60 26003YBYC $131.60 $3,948.00

14 60 EA 42250 FLUSH VALVE - SLOAN, MODEL 110 XL CLOSET -  #3080153 44495 $105.74 $6,344.40 110XL $131.00 $7,860.00

15 15 EA 42252 ZURN E-Z FLUSH (AUTO) ZZERKCPM 48888 $133.00 $1,995.00 ZERKCCPM $210.83 $3,162.45

16 19 EA 50035 MLD MEDICINE CABINET- R614 #781021 $75.00 $1,425.00  NO BID R614 $75.00 $1,425.00

17 100 EA 50042 ELKAY WATER SENTRY FILTERS- E51300CPROD Replacement EZH20 $99.00 $9,900.00  NO BID 51300C $99.00 $9,900.00

Parts Total $58,379.06 $66,378.60

Multiplied by 0.5 $29,189.53 $33,189.30

40,000.00$      Materials Discounted from List Price 20% 8,000.00$      32,000.00$    20% $8,000.00 $32,000.00

TOTAL $61,189.53 $65,189.30

Note to Bidders:  If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above 

within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date.  After that time, additional information may be requested

Williams Wholesale

by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us

Department / Requisition: 160267068

Description of Bid: Plumbing Parts/Supplies

Opening Date:  8/8/2022

Prepared by: Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.

Intent to Award Date*: 8/9/2022


