

Department / Requisition: Athletics / 181768577

Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.

Description of Bid: Softball Charter

Opening Date: 2/21/2024

RFQ Coordinator: Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

Qty	Unit	Item Description	Anchor Tours		First Class Charter		Metro Livery	
			Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
1	EA	Kennesaw State University – Kennesaw, GA	\$ 3,008.45	\$ 3,008.45	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00
1	EA	East Tennessee State University - Johnson City, TN	\$ 3,181.85	\$ 3,181.85	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00
1	EA	Bellarmine University – Louisville, KY	\$ 2,719.45	\$ 2,719.45	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00
1	EA	Austin Peay State University - Clarksville, TN	\$ 2,218.15	\$ 2,218.15	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00
1	EA	Tennessee State University - Nashville, TN	\$ 2,484.05	\$ 2,484.05	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00
1	EA	Tennessee State University – Nashville, TN	\$ 2,676.25	\$ 2,676.25	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00
		<b>TOTAL</b>		\$ 16,288.20		\$ 8,500.00		\$ <b>9,900.00</b>
Intent to Award Date*: 2/22/2024								
Note to Bidders: If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date. After that time, additional information may be requested by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at <a href="http://www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us">www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us</a>								