
Department / Requisition:  Athletics / 207360134 Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.

Description of Bid: Baseball Charter Service

Opening Date: 11/4/2025

RFQ Coordinator:  Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

Qty Unit Item Description Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes Unit Price Ext. Price Notes

1 EA Trip 1:  Nashville International airport – Nashville, TN (drop at BNA)  $                    750.00  $                    750.00  NO BID  $                          -    $               900.00  $               900.00  $            1,398.80  $            1,398.80  $            1,050.00  $                   1,050.00  $            1,500.00  $            1,500.00 

1 EA Trip 2:  Nashville International airport – Nashville, TN (pick up - BNA)  $                    750.00  $                    750.00  NO BID  $                          -    $               900.00  $               900.00  $            1,398.80  $            1,398.80  $            1,050.00  $                   1,050.00  $            1,500.00  $            1,500.00 

1 EA Trip 3:  Middle Tennessee University– Murfreesboro, TN  $                 1,400.00  $                 1,400.00  $               2,200.00  $               2,200.00  $            1,457.00  $            1,457.00  $            2,115.68  $            2,115.68  $            1,450.00  $                   1,450.00  $            1,650.00  $            1,650.00 
 Min 5 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 4:  Georgia Southern University – Statesboro, GA  $                 6,750.00  $                 6,750.00  $               5,950.00  $               5,950.00  $            6,748.00  $            6,748.00  $            7,168.80  $            7,168.80  $            6,800.00  $                   6,800.00  $          13,200.00  $          13,200.00 

1 EA Trip 5:  University of Tennessee – Knoxville, TN  $                 1,749.00  $                 1,749.00  No Bid  $                          -    $            1,695.00  $            1,695.00  $            1,960.00  $            1,960.00  $            1,650.00  $                   1,650.00  $            1,650.00  $            1,650.00 
 Min 5 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 6:  University of North Alabama – Huntsville, AL  $                 1,749.00  $                 1,749.00  No Bid  $                          -    $            1,750.00  $            1,750.00  $            2,772.00  $            2,772.00  $            1,600.00  $                   1,600.00  $            3,300.00  $            3,300.00 
 Min 10 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 7:  Vanderbilt University – Nashville, TN  $                 1,400.00  $                 1,400.00  $               2,200.00  $               2,200.00  $            1,695.00  $            1,695.00  $            2,233.50  $            2,233.50  $            1,500.00  $                   1,500.00  $            1,650.00  $            1,650.00 
 Min 5 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 8:  Southern Illinois University-Edwardsville – Edwardsville, IL  $                 5,396.00  $                 5,396.00  No Bid  $                          -    $            7,500.00  $            7,500.00  $            7,168.80  $            7,168.80  $            6,400.00  $                   6,400.00  $          13,200.00  $          13,200.00 

1 EA Trip 9:  Western Kentucky University – Bowling Green, KY  $                 1,749.00  $                 1,749.00  $               2,500.00  $               2,500.00  $            1,695.00  $            1,695.00  $            2,592.00  $            2,592.00  $            1,600.00  $                   1,600.00  $            3,300.00  $            3,300.00 
 Min 10 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 10:  University of Tennessee at Martin – Martin, TN  $                 5,400.00  $                 5,400.00  No Bid  $                          -    $            7,500.00  $            7,500.00  $            7,168.80  $            7,168.80  $            6,050.00  $                   6,050.00  $            1,650.00  $            1,650.00 

 Min 5 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

($2,670.01) 

1 EA Trip 11:  Austin Peay State University – Clarksville, TN  $                 1,749.00  $                 1,749.00  No Bid  $                          -    $            1,695.00  $            1,695.00  $            2,500.00  $            2,500.00  $            1,550.00  $                   1,550.00  $            1,650.00  $            1,650.00 
 Min 5 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 12:  Lipscomb University – Nashville, TN  $                 1,400.00  $                 1,400.00  $               2,200.00  $               2,200.00  $            1,695.00  $            1,695.00  $            2,233.50  $            2,233.50  $            1,500.00  $                   1,500.00  $            1,650.00  $            1,650.00 
 Min 5 hrs. / $330 per 

hr. thereafter 

1 EA Trip 13:  Southern Indiana University – Evansville, IN  $                 5,496.00  $                 5,496.00  $               5,950.00  $               5,950.00  $            6,748.00  $            6,748.00  $            7,168.80  $            7,168.80  $            6,200.00  $                   6,200.00  $          13,200.00  $          13,200.00 

 $                              -   

1 EA Trip 14:  Lindenwood University – St. Charles, MO  $                 5,496.00  $                 5,496.00  No Bid  $                          -    $            6,936.00  $            6,936.00  $            7,168.80  $            7,168.80  $            6,800.00  $                   6,800.00  $          13,200.00  $          13,200.00 

TOTAL  $           41,234.00  $         21,000.00  $      48,914.00  $      55,048.28  $                 45,200.00  $          72,300.00 

1 EA  $                 6,975.00  $                 6,975.00  $               7,400.00  $               7,400.00  $            8,475.00  $            8,475.00  $            8,961.00  $            8,961.00  $            8,500.00  $                   8,500.00  $          16,500.00  $          16,500.00 

OVC Trip Total 6,975.00$                  7,400.00$               8,475.00$             8,961.00$             8,500.00$                    16,500.00$           

Avgerage Cost Per Day 1,395.00$                  1,480.00$               1,695.00$             1,792.20$             1,700.00$                    3,300.00$             

TOTAL 48,209.00$            28,400.00$         57,389.00$       64,009.28$       53,700.00$             88,800.00$       

Gray Line ToursMartin MotorAnchor TransportationSignature Transportation

Intent to Award Date: 11/5/2025

by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us

Note to Bidders:  If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above 

within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date.  After that time, additional information may be requested

Metro Livery First Class

Trip 15:  Possible OVC Tournament – Marion, IL


